
 
Video Consent and Release Form (Adult) 

I, _______________________________________, hereby give The Mohawk College of Applied 
Arts and Technology (“Mohawk”) its employees, agents, assigns, and legal representatives the 
irrevocable right to use my name, photograph, image, audio recording, video recording and 
likeness in ___________________________________________________ (“Production”) in all 
forms and manner, including but not limited to, publication on Mohawk owned property, print 
media, digital media, the Internet, social media sites, promotional and training videos, in all 
media worldwide, without further notification to you.  
 
I waive rights to privacy and compensation, which I may have in connection with such use of 
my name and likeness, including rights that may be created in connection with the video 
production, editing and promotion therewith. 
 
I also hereby release and forever discharge Mohawk and all of its affiliates, subsidiaries, 
predecessors and present and former governors, officers, directors, employees, servants and 
agents (“Releasees”) from any and all actions, causes of actions, suits, debts, demands, 
covenants, complaints, contracts, claims, applications, damages, liabilities, statutory rights 
and obligations, representations, warranties and torts (both intentional and unintentional) 
whether presently known or unknown, which I may have or may hereafter have against Mohawk 
for any damages including but not limited to, death, personal injury, property damage, property 
theft, arising out of or in any way related to my participation in the Production, except for 
damages caused directly by the gross negligence of Mohawk. 
 
I have read this waiver and release and am familiar with its content.  I acknowledge that I have 
been advised of all the risks involved in the Production and that I have had adequate opportunity 
to read, understand and consider this Waiver and Release and obtain independent legal advice 
with respect thereto.  
 
I also acknowledge that I am signing this Waiver and Release voluntarily without coercion and 
without reliance on any representation, whether express or implied, by Mohawk. 
 
 
DATE:     _______________________________ 
 
NAME OF PARTICIPANT:  _______________________________ 
 
SIGNATURE:   _______________________________ 
 

 


